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ROAD RACING (MOTOR VEHICLE RALLY) (No. 2) 

(JERSEY) ORDER 2015 

Made   

Coming into force   

THE MINISTER FOR TRANSPORT AND TECHNICAL SERVICES , in 
pursuance of Article 2 of the Motor Vehicle Races (Jersey) Law 1946 and on 
the application of the Jersey Motor Cycle and Light Car Club, orders as 
follows – 

1 Interpretation 

(1) The provisions of this Order apply subject to those of the Road Racing 
(General Provisions) (Jersey) Order 1959 (“the 1959 Order”). 

(2) For the purposes of this Order and the 1959 Order, the “promoters” are 
the Jersey Motor Cycle and Light Car Club. 

2 Use of courses in Schedule for races with motor vehicles 

For the purpose of races with motor vehicles, the promoters may – 

(a) use the public roads or parts of public roads described in the Schedule 
(the “courses”); and 

(b) close the courses to traffic, 

on the dates and between the hours specified in relation to each course. 
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3 Citation 

This Order may be cited as the Road Racing (Motor Vehicle Rally) (No. 2) 
(Jersey) Order 2015. 

 

 

Signed.................................................................... 

Date........................................................................ 

Minister for Transport and Technical Services 
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SCHEDULE 

(Article 2) 

COURSES 

1 Maufant Stage 

On Friday 9th October 2015 between 12 noon and 5 p.m. a course in the parishes of 
St. Martin and St. Saviour comprising: La Rue de Payn from its junction with La 
Grande Route de Faldouet to its junction with La Longue Rue; thence along La 
Longue Rue to its junction with La Rue de l’Orme; thence along La Rue de l’Orme to 
its junction with La Rue de Beuvelande; thence along La Rue de Beuvelande to its 
junction with La Rue du Bouillon; thence along La Rue du Bouillon to its junction 
with La Rue des Alleurs; thence along La Rue des Alleurs to its junction with La Rue 
du Ministre; thence along La Rue du Ministre to its junction with La Rue de la 
Chouquetterie; thence along La Rue de la Chouquetterie to its junction with Les Vaux; 
thence along Les Vaux and La Rue St. Julien to the latter’s junction with La Rue de 
Baudains; thence along La Rue de Baudains to its junction with La Rue du Rué; 
thence along La Rue du Rué and La Rue des Buttes to the latter’s junction with La 
Grande Route de St. Martin; thence along La Grande Route de St. Martin to its 
junction with La Rue Potirons; thence along La Rue Potirons to its junction with La 
Rue du Champ Colin and La Rue de la Bachauderie; thence along La Rue de la 
Bachauderie to its junction with La Rue de Neuilly; thence along La Rue de Neuilly to 
its junction with La Route du Champ Colin; thence along La Route du Champ Colin to 
its junction with La Route de la Hougue Bie. 

2 Ponterrin Stage 

On Friday 9th October 2015 between 12 noon and 5 p.m. a course in the parishes of 
St. Saviour, Trinity and St. Helier comprising: Le Mont Sohier from its junction with 
La Rue à la Dame to its junction with La Rue de St. Mannelier: thence along La Rue 
de St. Mannelier to its junction with La Fosse à l’Ecrivain; thence along La Fosse à 
l’Ecrivain to its junction with Le Petit Ponterrin; thence along Le Petit Ponterrin to its 
junction with La Rue du Ponterrin; thence along La Rue du Ponterrin to its junction 
with La Rue du Vieux Ménage; thence along La Rue du Vieux Ménage to its junction 
with La Rue du Pont; thence along La Rue du Pont to its junction with La Rue de la 
Guilleaumerie; thence along La Rue de la Guilleaumerie to its junction with La Rue 
du Ponterrin; thence along La Rue du Ponterrin to its junction with Le Mont de la 
Rosière; thence along Le Mont de la Rosière to its junction with La Commune; thence 
along La Commune to its junction with La Rue au Bailli; thence along La Rue au 
Bailli to its junction with La Rue du Moulin du Ponterrin; thence along La Rue du 
Moulin du Ponterrin to its junction with La Rue de la Croiserie; thence along La Rue 
de la Croiserie to its junction with La Rue de la Roulerie; thence along La Rue de la 
Roulerie to its junction with Well Lane; thence along Well Lane to its junction with 
Beechfield Lane. 

3 Archirondel Stage 

On Friday 9th October 2015 between 6 p.m. and 10.30 p.m. a course in the parish of 
St. Martin comprising: La Rue de la Perruque from its junction with La Rue des Pelles 
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to its junction with La Rue de Flicquet; thence along La Rue de Flicquet to its junction 
with La Rue du Villot; thence along La Rue du Villot and Le Grand Côtil to the 
latter’s junction with Le Mont des Ormes; thence along Le Mont des Ormes to its 
junction with La Route de Ste. Catherine; thence along La Route de Ste. Catherine to 
its junction with La Route Le Brun; thence along La Route Le Brun to its junction 
with La Rue des Viviers; thence along La Rue des Viviers to its junction with La Rue 
de la Solitude and La Rue du Champs du Rey; thence along La Rue du Champs du 
Rey to its junction with Le Mont de la Mare Ste. Catherine; thence along Le Mont de 
la Mare Ste. Catherine to its junction with with La Rue de la Genestière; thence along 
La Rue de la Genestière to its junction with La Rue du Froid Vent; thence along La 
Rue du Froid Vent to its junction with Le Mont des Landes; thence along Le Mont des 
Landes to its junction with La Route de la Côte; thence along La Route de la Côte and 
La Route d’Anne Port to the latter’s junction with Les Charrières d’Anneport; thence 
along Les Charrières d’Anneport to its junction with La Rue de Guilleaume et 
d’Anneville; thence along La Rue de Guilleaume et d’Anneville to its junction with La 
Grande Route de Faldouet. 

4 St. Clement Stage  

On Friday 9th October 2015 between 6 p.m. and 10.30 p.m. a course in the parishes of 
Grouville and St. Clement comprising: La Rue de Fauvic from its junction with La 
Grande Route des Sablons to its junction with La Rue du Parcq; thence along La Rue 
du Parcq and La Rue Malo to the latter’s junction with La Route des Côtils; thence 
along La Route des Côtils to its junction with La Rue de Fauvic and La Rue au Long; 
thence along La Rue au Long to its junction with La Rue des Nouettes; thence along 
La Rue des Nouettes to its junction with La Grande Route de St. Clement and La Rue 
du Crève Coeur; thence along La Rue du Crève Coeur and La Rue du Moulin à Vent 
to the latter’s junction with La Rue Laurens; thence along La Rue Laurens to its 
junction with La Grande Route de St. Clement; thence along La Grande Route de 
St. Clement to its junction with La Verte Rue; thence along La Verte Rue to its 
junction with La Rue du Pignon; thence along La Rue du Pignon to its junction with 
La Rue du Genestet; thence along La Rue du Genestet to its junction with La Rue au 
Blancq; thence along La Rue au Blancq to its junction with Les Huriaux; thence along 
Les Huriaux to its junction with La Rue Soulas; thence along La Rue Soulas to its 
junction with Les Fonds de Longueville; thence along Les Fonds de Longueville to its 
junction with La Rue du Coin; thence along La Rue du Coin to its junction with La 
Rue de la Blinerie; thence along La Rue de la Blinerie to a point 100 metres east of its 
junction with Plat Douet Road. 

5 Grève de Lecq Stage  

On Saturday 10th October 2015 between 7.45 a.m. and 12.45 p.m. a course in the 
parishes of St. Mary and St. Ouen comprising: La Cache from its junction with La 
Grande Rue to its junction with La Rue de la Hougue Mauger; thence along La Rue de 
la Hougue Mauger and La Rue des Touettes to the latter’s junction with La Rue de 
Crabbé; thence along La Rue de Crabbé in an easterly direction to its junction with La 
Charrière; thence along La Charrière to its junction with La Rue du Pont; thence along 
La Rue du Pont to its junction with Le Hurel; thence along Le Hurel to its junction 
with La Charrière; thence along La Charrière to its junction with La Rue du Rondin; 
thence along La Rue du Rondin to its junction with La Rue de Crabbé; thence along 
La Rue de Crabbé in a westerly direction and Le Chemin du Câtel to the latter’s 
junction with Le Mont de Ste. Marie; thence along Le Mont de Ste. Marie to its 
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junction with Le Mont Vibert; thence along Le Mont Vibert to its junction with La 
Rue de la Ville au Neveu; thence along La Rue de la Ville au Neveu to its junction 
with La Rue Mahier; thence along La Rue Mahier to its junction with La Rue du Pont; 
thence along La Rue du Pont to its junction with Le Chemin de l’Église. 

6 St. Ouen Stage  

On Saturday 10th October 2015 between 7.45 a.m. and 12.45 p.m. a course in the 
parish of St. Ouen comprising: La Route du Marais from its junction with Les Ruettes 
to its junction with Rue Henri Gonay; thence along Rue Henri Gonay to its junction 
with La Rue de Grantez; thence along La Rue de Grantez to its junction with La Rue 
de la Fontaine; thence along La Rue de la Fontaine to its junction with Le Vier Mont; 
thence along Le Vier Mont to its junction with Le Mont Pinel; thence along Le Mont 
Pinel to its junction with Le Mont des Corvées; thence along Le Mont des Corvées to 
its junction with La Rue des Bonnes Femmes; thence along La Rue des Bonnes 
Femmes, La Rue de la Robeline, La Rue des Hougues and Le Mont Vibert to its 
junction with Le Mont Huelin; thence along Le Mont Huelin to its junction with La 
Route de la Villaise and La Rue Freule; thence along La Rue Freule to its junction 
with La Rue à la Pendue and La Rue de la Trappe; thence along La Rue de la Trappe 
to its junction with La Route des Landes; thence along La Route des Landes to its 
junction with La Rue de la Pointe; thence along La Rue de la Pointe to its junction 
with La Route de Grosnez; thence along La Route de Grosnez to its junction with La 
Rue du Val Bachelier; thence along La Rue du Val Bachelier to its junction with La 
Rue des Pallières; thence along La Rue des Pallières to its junction with La Petite Rue; 
thence along La Petite Rue to its junction with La Rue du Sud; thence along La Rue 
du Sud to its junction with La Rue des Cosnets and La Rue du Nord; thence along La 
Rue du Nord to its junction with Les Doubles Caches; thence along Les Doubles 
Caches to its junction with La Rue de l’Etocquet; thence along La Rue de l’Etocquet 
to its junction with La Rue Platte Raie; thence along La Rue Platte Raie to its junction 
with Le Cointin; thence along Le Cointin to its junction with La Rue de l’Etocquet; 
thence along La Rue de l’Etocquet to its junction with La Ronche; thence along La 
Ronche to its junction with La Route de Trodez. 

7 St. Saviour Stage  

On Saturday 10th October 2015 between 12.45 p.m. and 5.30 p.m. a course in the 
parishes of St. Saviour and Grouville comprising: Princes Tower Road from its 
junction with La Rue des Friquettes to its junction with La Rue de la Houguette; 
thence along La Rue de la Houguette to its junction with La Rue des Friquettes; thence 
along La Rue des Friquettes to its junction with La Rue des Pigneaux; thence along La 
Rue des Pigneaux to its junction with La Rue de la Commune; thence along La Rue de 
la Commune to its junction with Princes Tower Road and La Rue de la Parade; thence 
along La Rue de la Parade to its junction with the un-named road leading to La Rue du 
Paradis; thence along the un-named road to its junction with La Rue du Paradis; 
thence along La Rue du Paradis to its junction with La Rue du Tapon; thence along La 
Rue du Tapon to its junction with La Rue de la Retraite; thence along La Rue de la 
Retraite to its junction with La Rue de la Freminerie; thence along La Rue de la 
Freminerie to its junction with La Rue St. Thomas; thence along La Rue St. Thomas to 
its junction with La Rue Messervy; thence along La Rue Messervy to its junction with 
Le Mont ès Neaux; thence along Le Mont ès Neaux to its junction with La Rue 
St. Thomas and La Rue du Val Poucin; thence along La Rue du Val Poucin to its 
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junction with Le Chemin du Radier; thence along Le Chemin du Radier to its junction 
with La Cache Simonet; thence along La Cache Simonet to its junction with La Rue 
du Boulivot. 

8 Trinity Stage  

On Saturday 10th October 2015 between 12.45 p.m. and 5.30 p.m. a course in the 
parish of Trinity comprising: La Verte Rue from its junction with La Rue ès Picots to 
its junction with La Rue du Travers; thence along La Rue du Travers to its junction 
with La Rue du Mont Pellier; thence along La Rue du Mont Pellier to its junction with 
La Rue du Moulin de Bas; thence along La Rue du Moulin de Bas to its junction with 
La Verte Rue; thence along La Verte Rue in a southerly direction to its junction with 
La Rue des Câteaux; thence along La Rue des Câteaux to its junction with La Verte 
Rue; thence along La Verte Rue in a northerly direction to its junction with La Rue du 
Câtel; thence along La Rue du Câtel to its junction with La Rue de la Falaise; thence 
along La Rue de la Falaise to its junction with La Rue de la Fosse; thence along La 
Rue de la Fosse to its junction with La Rue de la Pièce Mauger, thence along La Rue 
de la Pièce Mauger to its junction with La Rue de Dielamont; thence along La Rue de 
Dielamont to its junction with La Rue des Boulées; thence along La Rue des Boulées 
to its junction with La Rue des Grès; thence along La Rue des Grès to its junction with 
La Verte Rue; thence along La Verte Rue in a southerly direction to its junction with 
La Rue de la Blanche Pierre; thence along La Rue de la Blanche Pierre to its junction 
with La Rue du Clos Durell. 
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